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MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Cass County Commission 
 
FROM: Thomas Soucy, County Engineer 
 
DATE:  December 9, 2024 
 
SUBJECT: Consent Agenda Item for December 16, 2024 Commission Meeting:  Storm 

Sewer Pipe Quotes. 
 
 

Attached are the documents for Prinsco, Inc. for storm sewer pipes to be installed in conjunction 
with our CH2503 & CB2503 Project on Cass County Highway 10 from Cass County Highway 1 
(Tower City) to State Highway 38. A request for quotes was sent to two different suppliers 
Advanced Drainage Systems, Inc. and Prinsco, Inc. The quotes were received as follows. 
 

 
 

 Engineers 
Estimate 

Prinsco, Inc. Advanced Drainage 
Systems, Inc. 

CH2503 & CB2503 $500,000.00 $475,303.72 $580,562.58 

 
This project was approved in our 2025 budget, and plan to construct during the 2025 
construction season.  
 
SUGGESTED MOTION: Authorize Chairperson to sign the quote from Prinsco, Inc. for the 
above stated project.  
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SoucyT
Tom Soucy



SALES PERSON

Matt Baragary

Phone: 320-212-5837

Email: Matt.Baragary@prinsco.com

SALES QUOTE

QT-12891

R.0

12/06/2024

01/05/2025

Quote #:

Quote Date:

Expires On:

Qty Unit Item # Item - Description Unit Price Total

40.00 FT 18GF20NP-WT-M294  _V       18" X 20' Goldflo Non-Perf W/WT Gasket M294 
Std.

$12.2900 $491.600

1,720.00 FT 24GP20NP-WT-M330  _       24" X 20' Goldpro Polypro Non-Perf W/WT 
Gasket M330 Std.

$24.6200 $42,346.400

1,280.00 FT 36GP20NP-WT-M330  G1       36" X 20' Goldpro Polypro Non-Perf W/WT 
Gasket M330 Std.

$42.7800 $54,758.400

620.00 FT 42GP20NP-WT-M330  G1       42" X 20' Goldpro Polypro Non-Perf W/WT 
Gasket M330 Std.

$54.8500 $34,007.000

2,260.00 FT 48GP20NP-WT-M330  G1       48" X 20' Goldpro Polypro Non-Perf W/WT 
Gasket M330 Std.

$74.2600 $167,827.600

1,480.00 FT 60GP20NP-WT-M330  G1       60" X 20' Goldpro Polypro Non-Perf W/WT 
Gasket M330 Std.

$104.1100 $154,082.800

1.00 EA T4218-GF  G1       42" X 18" Goldflo Reducing Tee $508.5400 $508.540

3.00 EA T4818-GF  G1       48" X 18" Goldflo Reducing Tee $513.0400 $1,539.120

2.00 EA T6018-GF  G1       60" X 60" X 18" Goldflo Tee $1,455.1000 $2,910.200

1.00 EA R4842-GF  G1       48" X 42" Goldflo Reducer $762.0500 $762.050

1.00 EA R6048-GF  G1       60" X 48" Goldflo Reducer $1,311.5700 $1,311.570

2.00 EA E24-902P-GF  _       24" Goldflo 90 Degree 2-Part Elbow $161.2500 $322.500

1.00 EA T24-GF  _       24" X 24" X 24" Goldflo Tee $232.8300 $232.830

2.00 EA E24-11.25-GF  _       24" Goldflo 11.25 Degree Elbow $76.7800 $153.560

1.00 EA E24-22.5-GF  _       24" Goldflo 22.5 Degree Elbow $121.9600 $121.960

10.00 EA SC24-TF  _       24" Split Coupler Thermoformed $33.7000 $337.000

3.00 EA SC42-TF  _       42" Split Coupler 2 Part Thermoformed $132.2700 $396.810

Cass County, ND Project - Cass County, NDPROJECT: 

CUST NO CUSTOMER NAME TERMS

C40000570 Net 60
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QUOTE: Cass County Highway Department

Office – 701-298-2380

Cell – 701-630-8667

USA

CONTACT: 

FAX: 

EMAIL: 

Kyle Litchy, PE (Assistant County Engineer)

LitchyK@casscountynd.gov

Cass County Highway Department



SALES PERSON

Matt Baragary

Phone: 320-212-5837

Email: Matt.Baragary@prinsco.com

SALES QUOTE

QT-12891

R.0

12/06/2024

01/05/2025

Quote #:

Quote Date:

Expires On:

Qty Unit Item # Item - Description Unit Price Total

8.00 EA SC48-TF  _       48" Split Coupler 3 Part Thermoformed $147.2700 $1,178.160

5.00 EA MM60 60" Marmac Polyseal Coupler $228.8600 $1,144.300

3.00 EA IND24-D-24HDPE  _ 24" Inline Drain W/Light Duty Domed Grate $1,846.8800 $5,540.640

3.00 EA GSK24-SA-WT  _       24" Goldflo WT Saddle Gasket $47.8800 $143.640

2.00 EA DB24-D-05 24" Drain Basin W/H-10 Domed Grate, 0'-5' $2,296.8800 $4,593.760

6.00 EA BG18 18" Bar Guard, Yellow $98.8800 $593.280

*All Prices Shown in United States Dollar Total: $475,303.72

Sales Tax not calculated on above quote.

We reserve the right to ship from other sources and to meet any competitive quote.

A 1.5% per month finance charge will be added to any unpaid amount 30 days after date of invoice.

PRINSCO Authorized Signature(s):

ACCEPTED:
The above prices, specifications, conditions, and terms are satisfactory and are hereby accepted.

You are authorized to provide the materials as specified. Payment will be made as outlined above.

Authorized Customer Signature / Title Date:

SPECIAL NOTES: ** DELIVERED PRICING TO JOB SITE **
** QUOTE REVISED ON 12/6/34 **
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Vector Control 
 

              Telephone: 701-298-2382 
             Fax: 701-298-2395 

  vector@casscountynd.gov 
  

  
 
 

 
 

 
TO: Cass County Commission 

211 9th Street S. 
Fargo, ND 58103 

 
FROM: Ben Prather, Vector Control Director 
 
DATE:  Tuesday, December 10, 2024 
 
SUBJECT: Approve purchase of pickup trucks from Nelson Ford 
 
 
2025 Budget includes funds for replacement a pickup used in mosquito control activities.  
 
The scheduled replacement cycle for this equipment is approximately an 11-year interval.  
 
The selected truck was the lowest priced state bid pickup option for a 4x4 crew cab truck. 
 
 
SUGGESTED MOTION: 
 
Authorize Chairman to approve the purchase in the amount of $44,220 
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ITEM QTY UNIT SPECS FORD/ Model Unit Price RAM/ Model Unit Price GMC/ Model Unit Price Make/ Model Unit Price

1 2 each Bismarck NO BID NO BID NO BID NA
2 2 each Valley City NO BID NO BID NO BID NA
3 1 each Devils Lake NO BID NO BID NO BID NA
4 1 each Minot NO BID NO BID NO BID NA
5 2 each Grand Forks NO BID NO BID NO BID NA
6 2 each Fargo NO BID NO BID NO BID NA

7 1 each Bismarck F250 X2B $47,877.00 NO BID Sierra 2500 TK20953 $46,711.00 Chevrolet CK20953 $47,312.00
8 1 each Grand Forks F250 X2B $47,833.00 NO BID Sierra 2500 TK20953 $46,667.00 Chevrolet CK20953 $47,312.00
9 1 each Fargo F250 X2B $47,778.00 NO BID Sierra 2500 TK20953 $46,612.00 Chevrolet CK20953 $47,312.00

10 1 each Bismarck NO BID NO BID Sierra 2500 TK20753 $46,526.00 Chevrolet CK20753 $47,123.60

11 1 each Bismarck F250 W2B $49,200.00 Ram 2500 DJ7L91 $46,672.00 Sierra 2500 TK20743 $48,392.00 Chevrolet CK20743 $49,026.40
12 1 each Valley City F250 W2B $49,146.00 Ram 2500 DJ7L91 $46,618.00 Sierra 2500 TK20743 $48,338.00 Chevrolet CK20743 $49,026.40
13 1 each Devils Lake F250 W2B $49,191.00 Ram 2500 DJ7L91 $46,663.00 Sierra 2500 TK20743 $48,383.00 Chevrolet CK20743 $49,026.40
14 1 each Minot F250 W2B $49,273.00 Ram 2500 DJ7L91 $46,745.00 Sierra 2500 TK20743 $48,465.00 Chevrolet CK20743 $49,026.40
15 1 each Grand Forks F250 W2B $49,156.00 Ram 2500 DJ7L91 $46,628.00 Sierra 2500 TK20743 $48,348.00 Chevrolet CK20743 $49,026.40

16 1 each Bismarck NO BID Ram 2500 DJ7L92 $46,853.00 Sierra 2500 TK20943 $48,577.00 Chevrolet CK20943 $49,215.60
17 1 each Minot NO BID Ram 2500 DJ7L92 $46,926.00 Sierra 2500 TK20943 $48,650.00 Chevrolet CK20943 $49,215.60

18 5 each Bismarck NO BID Ram 3500 D28L92 $47,765.00 Sierra 3500 TK30943 $49,509.00 Chevrolet CK30943 $49,486.30
19 1 each Valley City NO BID Ram 3500 D28L92 $47,711.00 Sierra 3500 TK30943 $49,455.00 Chevrolet CK30943 $49,486.30
20 2 each Devils Lake NO BID Ram 3500 D28L92 $47,756.00 Sierra 3500 TK30943 $49,500.00 Chevrolet CK30943 $49,486.30
21 1 each Minot NO BID Ram 3500 D28L92 $47,838.00 Sierra 3500 TK30943 $49,582.00 Chevrolet CK30943 $49,486.30
22 3 each Grand Forks NO BID Ram 3500 D28L92 $47,721.00 Sierra 3500 TK30943 $49,465.00 Chevrolet CK30943 $49,486.30
23 1 each Fargo NO BID Ram 3500 D28L92 $47,666.00 Sierra 3500 TK30943 $49,410.00 Chevrolet CK30943 $49,486.30

24 1 each Bismarck NO BID Ram 3500 D28L91 $47,384.00 Sierra 3500 TK30743 $49,324.00 Chevrolet CK30743 $49,297.10
25 1 each Fargo NO BID Ram 3500 D28L91 $47,285.00 Sierra 3500 TK30743 $49,225.00 Chevrolet CK30743 $49,297.10

26 1 each Bismarck NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30943 $57,939.00 Chevrolet CK30943 $58,122.20
27 1 each Devils Lake NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30943 $57,930.00 Chevrolet CK30943 $58,122.20
28 1 each Minot NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30943 $58,012.00 Chevrolet CK30943 $58,122.20
29 1 each Fargo NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30943 $57,840.00 Chevrolet CK30943 $58,122.20

30 1 each Bismarck NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30743 $57,754.00 Chevrolet CK30743 $58,342.50
31 1 each Fargo NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30743 $57,655.00 Chevrolet CK30743 $58,342.50

32 1 each Bismarck NO BID Ram 3500 D28L92 $48,927.00 Sierra 3500 TK30943 $51,261.00 Chevrolet CK30943 $50,621.50
33 1 each Fargo NO BID Ram 3500 D28L92 $48,828.00 Sierra 3500 TK30943 $51,162.00 Chevrolet CK30943 $50,621.50

34 3 each Bismarck NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30953 $47,643.00 Chevrolet CK30953 $47,583.50

35 1 each Devils Lake NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30953 $47,634.00 Chevrolet CK30953 $47,583.50

36 2 each Minot NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30953 $47,716.00 Chevrolet CK30953 $47,583.50

37 4 each Fargo NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30953 $47,544.00 Chevrolet CK30953 $47,583.50

38 1 each Bismarck NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30953 $56,072.00 Chevrolet CK30953 $56,219.40
39 1 each Valley City NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30953 $56,018.00 Chevrolet CK30953 $56,219.40
40 1 each Minot NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30953 $56,145.00 Chevrolet CK30953 $56,219.40
41 1 each Fargo NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30953 $55,973.00 Chevrolet CK30953 $56,219.40

42 1 each Bismarck NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30953 $57,824.00 Chevrolet CK30953 $57,354.60
43 1 each Minot NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30953 $57,897.00 Chevrolet CK30953 $57,354.60
44 1 each Grand Forks NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30953 $57,780.00 Chevrolet CK30953 $57,354.60
45 1 each Fargo NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30953 $57,725.00 Chevrolet CK30953 $57,354.60

46 1 each Bismarck NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30953 $49,137.00 Chevrolet CK30953 $48,619.60
47 0 each Fargo NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30953 $49,038.00 Chevrolet CK30953 $48,619.60

48 10 each Bismarck F150 X1L $43,319.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10753 $43,032.00 Chevrolet CK10753 $43,246.60
49 1 each Valley City F150 X1L $43,265.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10753 $42,978.00 Chevrolet CK10753 $43,246.60
50 1 each Devils Lake F150 X1L $43,310.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10753 $43,023.00 Chevrolet CK10753 $43,246.60
51 2 each Minot F150 X1L $43,392.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10753 $43,105.00 Chevrolet CK10753 $43,246.60
52 2 each Grand Forks F150 X1L $43,275.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10753 $42,988.00 Chevrolet CK10753 $43,246.60
53 6 each Fargo F150 X1L $43,220.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10753 $42,933.00 Chevrolet CK10753 $43,246.60

54 3 each Bismarck F150 W1L $44,319.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10543 $45,236.00 Chevrolet CK10543 $45,803.35
55 1 each Valley City F150 W1L $44,265.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10543 $45,182.00 Chevrolet CK10543 $45,803.35
56 1 each Devils Lake F150 W1L $44,310.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10543 $45,227.00 Chevrolet CK10543 $45,803.35
57 1 each Minot F150 W1L $44,392.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10543 $45,309.00 Chevrolet CK10543 $45,803.35
58 1 each Grand Forks F150 W1L $44,275.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10543 $45,192.00 Chevrolet CK10543 $45,803.35

***59 1 each Fargo F150 W1L $44,220.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10543 $45,137.00 Chevrolet CK10543 $45,803.35

60 1 each Bismarck F150 W1L $45,041.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10743 $45,518.00 Chevrolet CK10743 $45,773.15

Awarded items are highlighted in Yellow

SSP4-5 

SSP9-3 6,800 GVWR 4DR CREW CAB 4X4 PICKUP MODEL 1500/F150

Bid Summary

SSP4-19 

SSP4-16 

10,500 GVWR CREW CAB 4X4 PICKUP LB MODEL 2500/F250

SSP4-11 

IFB 110.7-24-064 - TC 377 - Pickups -  Current Production Year

BIDDER Name:

SSP4-4

SSP4-10

10,500 GVWR CREW CAB 4X4 SRW PICKUP LB MODEL 

10,000 GVWR 4 DR EXT CAB 4X4 PICKUP LB MODEL 

10,000 GVWR 4 DR EXT CAB 4X4 PICKUP SB MODEL 

SSP3-3 10,000 GVWR 4 DR EXT CAB 4X4 PICKUP LB MODEL 

SSP4-18 10,500 GVWR 4 DR EXT CAB 4X4 DIESEL DRW PICKUP LB 

SSP9-2 6,900 GVWR 4DR CREW CAB 4X4 PICKUP SB MODEL 

SSP4-14 10,500 GVWR CREW CAB 4X4 DIESEL SRW PICKUP SB 

10,500 GVWR 4 DR EXT CAB 4X4 DRW PICKUP LB MODEL 

SSP4-12 

14,000 GVWR CREW CAB 4X4 DRW PICKUP LB MODEL 

10,500 GVWR CREW CAB 4X4 SRW PICKUP SB MODEL 

SSP4-15 

SSP9-1

SSP4-17 

14,000 GVWR 4 DR EXT CAB 4X4 DRW PICKUP LB MODEL 

6,900 GVWR 4DR EXT CAB 4X4 PICKUP SB MODEL 1500/F150

13,000 GVWR CREW CAB 4X4 DRW PICKUP LB MODEL 

10,500 GVWR 4 DR EXT CAB 4X4 SRW PICKUP LB MODEL 

SSP4-3

10,000 GVWR 4 DR CREW CAB 4X4 PICKUP SB MODEL 

SSP4-13

Puklich Chevrolet IncNELSON AUTO CENTER, INC

***Vector Control Purchase- Line Item 59
ND STATE BID RESULTS- Pickups



61 1 each Valley City F150 W1L $44,987.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10743 $45,464.00 Chevrolet CK10743 $45,773.15
62 1 each Devils Lake F150 W1L $45,032.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10743 $45,509.00 Chevrolet CK10743 $45,773.15
63 1 each Minot F150 W1L $45,114.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10743 $45,591.00 Chevrolet CK10743 $45,773.15
64 1 each Grand Forks F150 W1L $44,997.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10743 $45,474.00 Chevrolet CK10743 $45,773.15
65 1 each Fargo F150 W1L $44,942.00 NO BID Sierra 1500 TK10743 $45,419.00 Chevrolet CK10743 $45,773.15

66 1 each Fargo NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK31003 $45,602.00 Chevrolet CK31003 $46,411.50

67 1 each Fargo NO BID NO BID Sierra 3500 TK31403 $45,449.00 Chevrolet CK31403 $46,600.70

72 2 each Bismarck F350 W3D $60,527.00 NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30943 $59,180.00 Chevrolet CK30943 $59,257.40

73 3 each Minot F350 W3D $60,600.00 NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30943 $59,253.00 Chevrolet CK30943 $59,257.40

74 7 each Fargo F350 W3D $60,428.00 NO BID Sierra 3500 TK30943 $59,081.00 Chevrolet CK30943 $59,257.40

75 1 each Bismarck F550 X5H $69,281.00 NO BID NO BID NA

76 1 each Bismarck F450 W4D $63,930.00 NO BID NO BID NA

77 1 each Fargo F650 F6A $68,921.00 NO BID NO BID NA

78 1 each Fargo F550 W5H $70,546.00 NO BID NO BID NA

79 1 each Fargo F550 W5H $70,708.00 NO BID NO BID NA

SSP12-10 13,000 GVWR REG CAB CHASSIS 4X4 DRW W/SNOW PLOW 

SSP18-12 5500/F550 4X4 CHASSIS CREW CAB DRW CA 84”

SSP18-4

SSP18-2 14,000 GVWR CREW CAB 4X4 DRW PICKUP LB MODEL F450

Delivery time ARO: 90-120 Days ARO subject 

SSP18-11 

13,000 GVWR REG CAB CHASSIS 4X4 DRW W/SNOW PLOW 

Toll Free Telephone Number:
Telephone Number:

TRUCK, REAR WHEEL DRIVE 25,500 LB GVW

5500/F550 4X4 CHASSIS CREW CAB DRW CA 60”

Service Representative Name:

SSP18-1

SSP15-5

SSP12-14

13,000 GVWR CREW CAB 4X4 DIESEL DRW PICKUP LB 

550 4X4 CHASSIS EXTENDED CAB DRW

218-282-3585

SERVICE REPRESENTATIVE RESPONSE FORM- Must be completed or bid 
Melissa Larson
800-477-3013
218-998-8865
218-998-8813

mlarson@nelsonfleet.com
               Cell Phone Number:

Fax Number:
Email Address: szaun@puklich-chevrolet.com

701-720-2331

Steve J Zaun
800-552-2299
701-223-5800
701-223-7958



 

 
 

211 9th Street South, Fargo, ND 58103  |  www.casscountynd.gov 

Vector Control 
 

              Telephone: 701-298-2382 
             Fax: 701-298-2395 

  vector@casscountynd.gov 
  

  
 
 

 
 

Tuesday, December 10, 2024 
 
TO: Cass County Commission 

211 9th Street S. 
Fargo, ND 58103 

 
FROM: Ben Prather, Vector Control Director 
 
DATE:  Tuesday, December 10, 2024 
 
SUBJECT:  Approve purchase of UTV’s from Moorhead Marine 
 
2025 Budget includes funds for replacement of 3 side by side off road utility vehicles used in the 
treatment of interstates, state and county highways and various other areas. The scheduled 
replacement cycle for this equipment is a 4-year interval.  
 
 
SUGGESTED MOTION: 
 
Authorize Chairman to approve the purchase in the amount of $46,220 
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